TR I DRI GIRT TIS PRI T

Clarification letter by

Concerned Divisional Forest Officer
BNTU TR / Government of Haryana

ERATUT 11-gReror J1fef=, 1900 (1900 T USTTE T AT 1) 3reraT 9= ierar ufirafed Jff & Hag 3 FR1& yH1or o |

NOC in respect of Haryana Land and Preservation Act, 1900 (Punjab Act, II of 1900) or Forest or Restricted lands.

ik I 9T

Name Ajeet Sharma

FISH T A

Organisation Name A And D Estates Private Limited
CREIBRGI

Current Address Plot No 77 Sector 44 Gurugram,,
g T

Land Location KHERKI DAULA,Gurgaon,

I A1

Land Measurements 2.469 (Acre)

AT AR / JIET TR

Rectangle No./ Murba = 19

No.

Reference No. (SRN):- MYW-9YF-HCMP

SR e 1 foIfel / Date of Issuance: 18-11-2022

SR} @R+ &7 ¥ / Place of Issuance: Gurgaon

SR R 1T WTfeia_uT / Issuing Authority: Divisional Forest Officer

This is a Digitally Signed Certificate and does not require physical signature. The authenticity of this certificate can be
verified from the verification link mentioned below:

https://164.100.137.243/eservices/mobileapi/verify/clarification/MYWI9YFHCMP
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TR I JAfGBRI GIRT TUSIHROT I

Clarification letter by

Concerned Divisional Forest Officer
BNTU TR / Government of Haryana

R s1.uReror 1fef, 1900 (1900 T USTE T fAfa 1) 3rerdT 9= rerar ufcrafeid ff & ey o FR1& yH0r o |
NOC in respect of Haryana Land and Preservation Act, 1900 (Punjab Act, II of 1900) or Forest or Restricted lands.

Rhetr TreR Village-kherki Daula-19//1(4-18), 2 (8-0), 10(8-16)
Killa Number

PRI Building Construction
Purpose

IRt v+ 61 fiIfet / Date of Issuance: 18-11-2022
SIRY @R+ T ¥ / Place of Issuance: Gurgaon
SR} ) aTeT WTfeia_uT / Issuing Authority: Divisional Forest Officer

This is a Digitally Signed Certificate and does not require physical signature. The authenticity of this certificate can be
verified from the verification link mentioned below:

https://164.100.137.243/eservices/mobileapi/verify/clarification/MYWI9YFHCMP

10of3



TR I JAfGBRI GIRT TUSIHROT I

Clarification letter by

Concerned Divisional Forest Officer
BNTU TR / Government of Haryana

gRaTon g.ufReror fEf1E,1900 (1900 @1 USTTe T ATEFI 11) 3rerar o rerT Tfsfad f & Fee 3 FAR1EY T g
NOC in respect of Haryana Land and Preservation Act, 1900 (Punjab Act, II of 1900) or Forest or Restricted lands.
Applicant _Ajeet Sharma located at village /city KHERKI DAULA district _Gurgaon

made a proposal to use this land for _Building Construction . It is made clear that:

a) As per records available above said land is not part of notified Reserved Forest, Protected Forest under Indian Forest Act,
1927 or any area closed under section 4 of Punjab Land Preservation Act, 1900.

b) It is clarified that by the Notification No. S.0.8/P.A 2/1900/S. 4/2013 dated 4™ January, 2013, all Revenue Estate of
Gurgaon is notified u/s 4 of PLPA 1900 and S.0.81/PA.2/1900/5.3/2012 u/s 3 of PLPA 1900. The area is however
not recorded as forest in the Government record but felling of any tree is strictly prohibited without the permission of
Divisional Forest Officer, _Gurgaon

c) If approach is required from Protected Forest by the user agency, the clearance/ regularization under Forest
Conservation Act 1980 will be required. Without prior clearance from Forest Department, the use of Forest land for
approach road is strictly prohibited. M/s A And D Estates Private Limited

whose land is located at village/city, KHERKI DAULAistrict_Gurgaon must obtain clearance as applicable under
Forest Conservation Act 1980.

d) As per the records available with the Forest Department, Gurgaon the area does not fall in areas where
plantations were raised by the Forest Department under Aravalli project.

e) All other statutory clearances mandated under the Environment Protection Act. 1986, as per the notification of Ministry
of Environment and Forests, Government of India, dated 07-05-1992 or any other Act/ order shall be obtained as applicable
by the project proponents from the concerned authorities.

f) The project proponent will not violate any Judicial Order/ direction issued by the Hon'ble Supreme Court/ High Courts.

g) It is clarified that the Hon'ble Supreme Court has issued various judgments dated 07.05.2002, 29.10.2002, 16.12.2002,
18.03.2004, 14.05.2008 etc. pertaining to Aravalli region in Haryana, which should be complied with.

h) It shall be the responsiblity of user agency/ applicant to get necessary clearances/ permissions under various Acts and
Rules applicable if any, from the respective authorities/ Department.

i) This certificate is not applicable in case of Environment Department notification dated 10.03.2016 for Screening Plant,
and notification dated 11.05.2016 for Stone Crusher. Investor/Applicant has to take clearance from Environment
Department in case of Screening Plant and Stone Crusher .

It is subject to the following conditions:

1.Clarification Is Hereby Issued Subject To Conditions
Mentioned Above

Date: 18-11-2022 Rajeev Tejyan,

Place:_Gurgaon (Divisional Forest Officer)

This is a Digitally Signed Certificate and does not require physical signature. The authenticity of this certificate can be
verified from the verification link mentioned below:

https://164.100.137.243/eservices/mobileapi/verify/clarification/MYWI9YFHCMP
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TR I DRI GIRT TIS PRI T

Clarification letter by

Concerned Divisional Forest Officer
BNTU TR / Government of Haryana

ERATUT 11-gReror J1fef=, 1900 (1900 T USTTE T AT 1) 3reraT 9= ierar ufirafed Jff & Hag 3 FR1& yH1or o |

NOC in respect of Haryana Land and Preservation Act, 1900 (Punjab Act, II of 1900) or Forest or Restricted lands.

ik I 9T

Name Ajeet Sharma

HIS BT M

Organisation Name A And D Estates Private Limited
CREIBRGI

Current Address Plot No 77 Sector 44 Gurugram,,
g T

Land Location SIHI, Gurgaon,

CIGEIEE

Land Measurements 10.142 (Acre)

T THR / AT TR

Rectangle No./ Murba 47 And 48;

No.

Reference No. (SRN):- MR4-K5E-510W

SR e 1 foIfel / Date of Issuance: 18-11-2022

SR} @R+ &7 ¥ / Place of Issuance: Gurgaon

SR R 1T WTfeia_uT / Issuing Authority: Divisional Forest Officer

This is a Digitally Signed Certificate and does not require physical signature. The authenticity of this certificate can be
verified from the verification link mentioned below:

https://164.100.137.243/eservices/mobileapi/verify/clarification/MR4K5E510W
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TR I JAfGBRI GIRT TUSIHROT I

Clarification letter by

Concerned Divisional Forest Officer
BNTU TR / Government of Haryana

R s1.uReror 1fef, 1900 (1900 T USTE T fAfa 1) 3rerdT 9= rerar ufcrafeid ff & ey o FR1& yH0r o |
NOC in respect of Haryana Land and Preservation Act, 1900 (Punjab Act, II of 1900) or Forest or Restricted lands.

IERIGLEE Village-

Killa Number sihi-47//21/1/2(1-4),21/2/2(4-16),22/1/2(5-16),23/1/2(1-5),19/2(0-13),20/1/2(0-14),20/2/2(0-
4),21/1/1(0-8),21/2/1(1-12),22/1/1(2-0),23/1/1(1-2),
48//25/2(6-0),3/2(3-12),4/1(3-8),6/1/1(0-12),6/
2(6-12),7(8-0),14(8-0),15/1(6-12),16/2(0-18),25/1(2-0),17(8-0),24(8-0)

PRI Building Construction
Purpose

IRt v+ 61 fiIfet / Date of Issuance: 18-11-2022
SIRY @R+ T ¥ / Place of Issuance: Gurgaon
SR} ) aTeT WTfeia_uT / Issuing Authority: Divisional Forest Officer

This is a Digitally Signed Certificate and does not require physical signature. The authenticity of this certificate can be
verified from the verification link mentioned below:

https://164.100.137.243/eservices/mobileapi/verify/clarification/MR4K5E510W

10of3



TR I JAfGBRI GIRT TUSIHROT I

Clarification letter by

Concerned Divisional Forest Officer
BNTU TR / Government of Haryana

gRaTon g.ufReror fEf1E,1900 (1900 @1 USTTe T ATEFI 11) 3rerar o rerT Tfsfad f & Fee 3 FAR1EY T g
NOC in respect of Haryana Land and Preservation Act, 1900 (Punjab Act, II of 1900) or Forest or Restricted lands.
Applicant _Ajeet Sharma located at village /city SIHI district_Gurgaon

made a proposal to use this land for _Building Construction . It is made clear that:

a) As per records available above said land is not part of notified Reserved Forest, Protected Forest under Indian Forest Act,
1927 or any area closed under section 4 of Punjab Land Preservation Act, 1900.

b) It is clarified that by the Notification No. S.0.8/P.A 2/1900/S. 4/2013 dated 4™ January, 2013, all Revenue Estate of
Gurgaon is notified u/s 4 of PLPA 1900 and S.0.81/PA.2/1900/5.3/2012 u/s 3 of PLPA 1900. The area is however
not recorded as forest in the Government record but felling of any tree is strictly prohibited without the permission of
Divisional Forest Officer, _Gurgaon

c) If approach is required from Protected Forest by the user agency, the clearance/ regularization under Forest
Conservation Act 1980 will be required. Without prior clearance from Forest Department, the use of Forest land for
approach road is strictly prohibited. M/s A And D Estates Private Limited

whose land is located at village/city, _STHI District_Gurgaon must obtain clearance as applicable under
Forest Conservation Act 1980.

d) As per the records available with the Forest Department, Gurgaon the area does not fall in areas where
plantations were raised by the Forest Department under Aravalli project.

e) All other statutory clearances mandated under the Environment Protection Act. 1986, as per the notification of Ministry
of Environment and Forests, Government of India, dated 07-05-1992 or any other Act/ order shall be obtained as applicable
by the project proponents from the concerned authorities.

f) The project proponent will not violate any Judicial Order/ direction issued by the Hon'ble Supreme Court/ High Courts.

g) It is clarified that the Hon'ble Supreme Court has issued various judgments dated 07.05.2002, 29.10.2002, 16.12.2002,
18.03.2004, 14.05.2008 etc. pertaining to Aravalli region in Haryana, which should be complied with.

h) It shall be the responsiblity of user agency/ applicant to get necessary clearances/ permissions under various Acts and
Rules applicable if any, from the respective authorities/ Department.

i) This certificate is not applicable in case of Environment Department notification dated 10.03.2016 for Screening Plant,
and notification dated 11.05.2016 for Stone Crusher. Investor/Applicant has to take clearance from Environment
Department in case of Screening Plant and Stone Crusher .

It is subject to the following conditions:

1.Clarification Is Hereby Issued Subject To Conditions
Mentioned Above

Date: 18-11-2022 Rajeev Tejyan,

Place:_Gurgaon (Divisional Forest Officer)

This is a Digitally Signed Certificate and does not require physical signature. The authenticity of this certificate can be
verified from the verification link mentioned below:

https://164.100.137.243/eservices/mobileapi/verify/clarification/MR4K5E510W
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