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M Raj Kumar <raj@jmkbuild.in>

BUILDCONMN PVT LTD

Registration of bank details for receiving disbursement payments through
Electronic Funds Transfer (EFT)[1D:304449623]

1 message

SUSHMITHA KUNDAR <projectapproval@hdfc.com> 28 February 2023 at 11:53
To: RAJ@jmkbuild.in
Cc: sushmithak@hdfc.com

Dear Jmk Buildon Pvt Limited ,

This is with reference to your request dated 22-FEB-2023 made to HDFC for registration of your bank details with us for
receiving disbursement payments through Electronic Funds Transfer (EFT).

We wish to confirm that your registration has been completed and we will commence payments through EFT as and when
requests for the same are received from the customer who has complied to the terms and conditions of our offer
letter/loan documents, as determined by HDFC.

The following are the details that have been updated in our records:
- Project name :GREEHAA FLOORS (PHASE 1)

- Project ID :783348

- Bank account Number : 777705002339

- Name of Account Holder:Jmk Buildon Pvt Limited

- Name of Bank :ICIClI BANK LTD

- IFSC :ICIC0000399

Thanking you,

Yours faithfully,

For Housing Development Finance Corporation Ltd
SUSHMITHA KUNDAR

Email Id: sushmithak@hdfc.com

Tel no:

Disclaimer :The information contained herein (including any accompanying documents) is confidential and is intended
solely for the addressee(s). If you have erroneously received this message, please immediately delete it and notify the
sender. Also, if you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or
taking any action in reliance on the contents of this message or any accompanying document is strictly prohibited and is
unlawful. The arganisation is not responsible for any damage caused by a virus or alteration of the e-mail by a third party
or otherwise . The contents of this message may not necessarily represent the views or policies of Housing Development
Finance Corporation Limited.

Caik

Authorised Signatory
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Et‘—fﬁ Raj Kumar <raj@jmkbuild.in>

BUILDCON PV LTD

Greehaa Floors Phase-1 (At Reliance MET City) Jhajjar

1 message

Subodh Jain/Delhi <subodhj@hdfc.com> 23 February 2023 at 18:27

To: Raj Kumar <raj@jmkbuild.in>, Shweta Bajaj/HLSIL/Delhi <sbajaj@hdfcsupport.co.in>
Cc: Maaz Hasan/Bahadurgarh/Delhi <maaz.hasan@hdfc.com>, Sunil Sharma/Rohini/Delhi <sharmas@hdfc.com>, Dipak
Chakraborty <dipak65@jmkbuild.in>

We hereby confirm HDFC will be funding individual allotees in the project subject to their individual credit profile
Regards
Subodh Jain

Get Outlook for Android

From: Raj Kumar <raj@jmkbuild.in>

Sent: Thursday, February 23, 2023 4:01:42 PM

To: Shweta Bajaj/HLSIL/Delhi <sbajaj@hdfcsupport.co.in>; Subodh Jain/Delhi <subodhj@hdfc.com>

Cc: Maaz Hasan/Bahadurgarh/Delhi <maaz.hasan@hdfc.com>; Sunil Sharma/Reohini/Delhi
<sharmas@hdfc.com>; Dipak Chakraborty <dipak65@jmkbuild.in>

Subject: [External]Re: [External] Re: Fw: Legal appraise Greehaa Floors Phase-1 (At Reliance MET City) Jhajjar

|Warn|ng This email is from EXTERNAL source. Exercise caution whlle opening attachments / links.

Dear Shweta and Subodh ji,

Please suggest the status of our project approval certificate or such kind of information that we will share with our
customers, so they can apply for a loan in your esteemed bank.

Thanks and Regards,
Raj Kumar (+91 - 8178464761)
Manager

JMK Buildcon Pvt. Ltd.
Address: 912, Tower B, Emmar Digital Greens, Sector 61, Gurugram, Haryana

This email is for the use of the intended recipient(s) only. If you have received this email in error, please notify

the sender immediately and then delete it. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not keep, use, disclose,

copy or distribute this email without the author's prior permission. JMK Buildcon Pvt. Ltd., Gurgaon have taken
precautions to minimize the risk of transmitting software viruses, but we advise you to carry out your own virus
checks on any attachment to this message. We cannot accept liability for any loss or damage caused by
software viruses. The information contained in this communication may be confidential and may be subject to
the attorney-client privilege. If you are the intended recipient and you do not wish to receive similar electronic
messages from us in future then please respond to the sender to this effect.

On Wed, 22 Feb 2023 at 16:22, Raj Kumar <raj@jmkbuild.in> wrote:
Dear Shweta madam,

Please find the attachment with correct bank account details of the rera master account.

Thanks and Regards, _
Raj Kumar (+91 - 8178464761) Dilh
Manager Authorised Signatory
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